
  The Customer

The famous Hotel Kriopigi located 
in Kassandra peninsula at Halkidi-
ki Greece. Is a holiday resort sit-
uated near the village of Kriopigi.
Built at the most privileged spot of 
the village, at 120 m of altitude, 
by the woods, offers unlimited 
view to the Toroneos gulf and the 
entire area of Sithonia. The Hotel 
Kriopigi is built with respect to the 
local architectural style and has 
rooms, family apartments and 
junior suites fully equipped pro-
viding all commodities needed for 
a pleasant stay during your holi-
days in Halkidiki

  The Challenge

EDISION and TELEVES products 
were selected to provide solu-
tions and services for the high 
demands of Hotel KRIOPIGI. There 
was a need for upgrading the TV 
system and the choice for a pro-
fessional equipment was the one-
way street for such a hotel cate-
gory. This work has to do with the 
distribution of satellite and terres-
trial television signals as well as 
with the digital signage supply on 
the hotel’s televisions.

  The Solution

The installation of the TELEVES & 
EDISION professional equipment 
was carried out by an authorized 
EDISION technical partner that 
guarantee the distribution of the 
TV signal and dynamic advertis-
ing to the hotel’s TVs.

  Return on Investment

We collaborated with EDISION 
and upgraded our TV system to 
provide our visitors with services 
according to their needs and their 
expectations. We manage with the 
support of EDISION, to upgrade to 
high-level services in this field and 
to offer quality in experience for our 
customers, while at the same time 
we believe we have lay the founda-
tions and we are ready for the more 
demanding technological future. 
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